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This early work by Wilkie Collins was originally published in 1858. Born in Marylebone, London in 1824,
Collins' family enrolled him at the Maida Hill Academy in 1835, but then took him to France and Italy with
them between 1836 and 1838. Returning to England, Collins attended Cole's boarding school, and completed
his education in 1841, after which he was apprenticed to the tea merchants Antrobus & Co. in the Strand. In
1846, Collins became a law student at Lincoln's Inn, and was called to the bar in 1851, although he never
practiced. It was in 1848, a year after the death of his father, that he published his first book, The Memoirs of
the Life of William Collins, Esq., R.A., to good reviews. The 1860s saw Collins' creative high-point, and it
was during this decade that he achieved fame and critical acclaim, with his four major novels, The Woman in
White (1860), No Name (1862), Armadale (1866) and The Moonstone (1868). The Moonstone, meanwhile is
seen by many as the first true detective novel – T. S. Eliot called it "the first, the longest, and the best of
modern English detective novels...in a genre invented by Collins and not by Poe.” Many of the earliest
books, particularly those dating back to the 1900's and before, are now extremely scarce and increasingly
expensive. We are republishing these classic works in affordable, high quality, modern editions.
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From reader reviews:

Kara Corbett:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specifically book entitled The
Poisoned Meal the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe not
known for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a e-book then become
one application form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get prior to. The The Poisoned Meal
giving you another experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful facts for your
better life in this particular era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern the following is your body
and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a casino game. Do you want
to try this extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Cassie Merritt:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its include may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer may be The Poisoned Meal why because the great cover that make
you consider concerning the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content will be fantastic as
the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Morris Whitfield:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book than
can satisfy your short time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be study.
The Poisoned Meal can be your answer mainly because it can be read by anyone who have those short time
problems.

Liza Serrano:

Beside that The Poisoned Meal in your phone, it may give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or
facts. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from oven so don't always be worry if
you feel like an older people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have The Poisoned Meal because
this book offers to your account readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you rarely get what
it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable
option here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss the
item? Find this book and read it from currently!
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