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The girl looked terrified and somehow vaguely familiar, but Kristi had no idea who she was—or how she
could have simply vanished from a jumbo jet at 35,000 feet in the air! The Cameron family and friends are
on their way to Hawaii, expecting a great vacation and never dreaming of the mystery, adventure and
downright danger that would surround them in that lush tropical setting! Aloha, Hawaii! Kristi and her
brothers Dan and Skeeter, along with their friends Robyn, Anna and Pete, are having the time of their lives
surfing, horseback riding, swimming with dolphins and experiencing the unique Polynesian culture of the
islands. Someone is following them, though—following them all the way to small, deserted Ka Moku Ahi, or
the Island of Fire. Fun turns to mystery and a rescue mission as the Camerons seek a way off the island—and
hidden treasure! The first book in the Kristi Cameron series, The Secret of Fire Island introduces us to fun-
loving, spunky Kristi, her family and friends. There’s Dan, her good-looking, athletic older brother and
younger brother Skeeter—a redheaded goofball and magnet for mischief. Kristi’s best friends are Robyn, a
pretty blonde tomboy who’s almost as crazy as Skeeter, and sweet, gentle, South American beauty Anna.
Pete is Dan’s best friend and a “walking, talking encyclopedia” of fun facts and helpful information. Then
there are Kristi’s parents, Rachel and Steve—often a part of the action and fun, as well. Rachel is a
successful mystery writer and as energetic and high-spirited as her kids. Steve is a commercial pilot and also
owns his own small plane—which enables the whole gang to travel the country, and even the world, in
search of adventure! One thing is sure—the Camerons love the Lord and love others in His name! The
stories in the Kristi Cameron series are fun and exciting—but they are encouraging, as well, and meant to
inspire young people to know and walk with the Lord. Parents can expect good, wholesome literature in the
Kristi Cameron series—upholding godly values without excessive violence, bad language, the occult,
immoral conduct or disobedience to authority. Whether read alone or as a family, these books will uplift and
nurture all.
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From reader reviews:

Rhonda Rudder:

Do you among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
particular aren't like that. This The Secret of Fire Island (Kristi Cameron) (Volume 1) book is readable by
simply you who hate those straight word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable
examining experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer
connected with The Secret of Fire Island (Kristi Cameron) (Volume 1) content conveys thinking easily to
understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just
different available as it. So , do you still thinking The Secret of Fire Island (Kristi Cameron) (Volume 1) is
not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

James Fulk:

The actual book The Secret of Fire Island (Kristi Cameron) (Volume 1) has a lot associated with on it. So
when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was published by the very famous
author. Mcdougal makes some research before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you
will get the point easily after looking over this book.

Michael Barth:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this all time you only find book that
need more time to be study. The Secret of Fire Island (Kristi Cameron) (Volume 1) can be your answer since
it can be read by a person who have those short time problems.

Teresa White:

You will get this The Secret of Fire Island (Kristi Cameron) (Volume 1) by go to the bookstore or Mall. Just
viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this
e-book are various. Not only simply by written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by simply e-book.
In the modern era including now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what their
problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to
arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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