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Audra Alexander wants the ultimate championship title, the bracelet and the cool ten million dollar cash
prize, but when the chips stack up against her, Audra could use a full house-and Max is ready to give her
one. Only the one he has in mind doesn't have anything to do with poker. A professional gambler, Max is a
player's player. He's also considered quite charming with the ladies, but once he meets Audra Alexander for
the first time, he's hooked. After an initial meeting, he follows her career in hopes of one day coming face to
face with her again, and he gets his chance when he least expects it. When Max and Audra meet in Sin City,
Max isn't surprised at the way he responds to her. She catches him off his game and then does her dead-level
best to keep him off of it. Until, of course, he plays his hand with every intention of winning hers. ** A Siren
Erotic Romance
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From reader reviews:

Phyllis Branson:

The book Lying Eyes (Siren Publishing) can give more knowledge and information about everything you
want. So why must we leave a very important thing like a book Lying Eyes (Siren Publishing)? A few of you
have a different opinion about book. But one aim that will book can give many info for us. It is absolutely
right. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you are able to
give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Lying Eyes (Siren Publishing) has simple shape
however you know: it has great and large function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide
open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Robert Hester:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get great
deal of stress from both day to day life and work. So , if we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the book you have read is
definitely Lying Eyes (Siren Publishing).

Shirley Akins:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Lying Eyes (Siren Publishing) e-book written
by well-known writer who knows well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who all read
the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your
own hunger then you still doubt Lying Eyes (Siren Publishing) as good book not only by the cover but also
with the content. This is one e-book that can break don't assess book by its deal with, so do you still needing
yet another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to a different sixth sense.

Tessa Krieger:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok
you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Lying Eyes (Siren
Publishing) which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.
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