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Drifting silently on the water about forty nautical miles off the Texas coast, Charlie Sweetwater sits aboard
his boat, alone with his thoughts, when from the darkness he hears a man swimming toward him. But not just
any man. His name is Julien Dufay, the wealthy French scion of a family-owned petrochemical dynasty
headquartered in Houston. Charlie plucks the exhausted Frenchman from the Gulf of Mexico and delivers
him back to his rarified world. But of course, no good deed ever goes unpunished.  
 
As Charlie is drawn deeper into Julien’s erratic orbit, he discovers a man possessed. Dufay is consumed by
his vision of discovering the site of Fort Saint Louis: the famed—and doomed—17th century settlement of
French explorer, Robert Cavelier de La Salle.
 
Thanks to Julien, and his own restless curiosity, Charlie is pulled into a web of obsession, murder and greed.
Julien wants to find La Salle’s long-lost colony (and the treasure of artifacts buried with it) as a legacy for
himself, his family and the greater glory of France. But the project’s ambitious sponsor, Jean-Marc Dufay, is
hell-bent on getting at the rich natural gas resources hidden beneath the site, even if it means using his own
brother as a pawn to feed his ambitions. Standing in the way is the stubborn old man on whose South Texas
ranch Julien and Jean-Marc are converging, along with his trio of scurrilous sons, who have their own covert
agenda—an agenda that can be lethal to outsiders.
 
Charlie struggles to make sense of it all, with the help of the beautiful marine archeologist who is excavating
La Salle’s shipwreck La Belle in nearby Matagorda Bay. But as he digs deeper into Julien Dufay’s danger-
fraught quest, he discovers that history has a way of repeating itself, and that some ghosts just won't stay
buried.
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From reader reviews:

William Martin:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive at this point,
people have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the item
for a while is reading. Yep, by reading a publication your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay
than other is high. For yourself who want to start reading a new book, we give you this La Salle's Ghost book
as beginning and daily reading book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Dollie Simmons:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys this
specific aren't like that. This La Salle's Ghost book is readable by simply you who hate those straight word
style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving perhaps
decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer associated with La Salle's Ghost content
conveys objective easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
written content but it just different in the form of it. So , do you nevertheless thinking La Salle's Ghost is not
loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Jose Crawford:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specially book entitled La
Salle's Ghost your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe
unknown for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a publication
then become one contact form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get ahead of. The La Salle's
Ghost giving you an additional experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful info
for your better life in this particular era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern is your body and
mind are going to be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning an activity. Do you want to
try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Terry McConnell:

You could spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This La Salle's Ghost is simple bringing you
can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not include much space to
bring often the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can
save often the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this
book.
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