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What happens when we let robots play the game of life?
 
The challenge of studying evolution is that the history of life is buried in the past—we can’t witness the
dramatic events that shaped the adaptations we see today. But biorobotics expert John Long has found an
ingenious way to overcome this problem: he creates robots that look and behave like extinct animals,
subjects them to evolutionary pressures, lets them compete for mates and resources, and mutates their
‘genes’. In short, he lets robots play the game of life.
 
In Darwin’s Devices, Long tells the story of these evolving biorobots—how they came to be, and what they
can teach us about the biology of living and extinct species. Evolving biorobots can replicate creatures that
disappeared from the earth long ago, showing us in real time what happens in the face of unexpected
environmental challenges. Biomechanically correct models of backbones functioning as part of an
autonomous robot, for example, can help us understand why the first vertebrates evolved them.
 
But the most impressive feature of these robots, as Long shows, is their ability to illustrate the power of
evolution to solve difficult technological challenges autonomously—without human input regarding what a
workable solution might be. Even a simple robot can create complex behavior, often learning or evolving
greater intelligence than humans could possibly program. This remarkable idea could forever alter the face of
engineering, design, and even warfare.
 
An amazing tour through the workings of a fertile mind, Darwin’s Devices will make you rethink everything
you thought you knew about evolution, robot intelligence, and life itself.
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From reader reviews:

Doris Anderson:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be upgrade about what going on or details even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era which can be always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Darwin's Devices: What Evolving
Robots Can Teach Us About the History of Life and the Future of Technology is our recommendation to
cause you to keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Louise Lewis:

The ability that you get from Darwin's Devices: What Evolving Robots Can Teach Us About the History of
Life and the Future of Technology is a more deep you excavating the information that hide inside the words
the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to comprehend but
Darwin's Devices: What Evolving Robots Can Teach Us About the History of Life and the Future of
Technology giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in certain way that can
be understood by means of anyone who read the idea because the author of this book is well-known enough.
This specific book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can
go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this kind of Darwin's
Devices: What Evolving Robots Can Teach Us About the History of Life and the Future of Technology
instantly.

Sherry Clark:

This Darwin's Devices: What Evolving Robots Can Teach Us About the History of Life and the Future of
Technology is fresh way for you who has attention to look for some information given it relief your hunger
details. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having little bit of
digest in reading this Darwin's Devices: What Evolving Robots Can Teach Us About the History of Life and
the Future of Technology can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this specific
book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books produce itself in the form which is reachable by anyone,
yeah I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in guide form make them feel tired even dizzy
this guide is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a book especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book type for your better life and
also knowledge.

Curtis Waters:

With this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
special than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you
are related is just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of many



books in the top checklist in your reading list is actually Darwin's Devices: What Evolving Robots Can
Teach Us About the History of Life and the Future of Technology. This book which can be qualified as The
Hungry Inclines can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way up and review this book
you can get many advantages.
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