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Interior decorator Keith Irvine steamed into New York Harbor in 1957 and immediately embarked on
designing the unique, inspired interiors that have ensured him a place at the pinnacle of his field. His designs
are characterized by feeling—wit, grandeur, comfort, drama—as well as by exquisite use of color, pattern,
lighting, furniture, and accessories. Born in Scotland and trained in his profession in London—notably by the
decorating legend John Fowler—Irving combines old-world wisdom and new-world enthusiasm in his
mostly traditional rooms and houses. The first book on his work, Keith Irvine: A Life in Decoration—written
by Irvine and his wife, noted design writer Chippy Irvine—is at once illustrated autobiography, collection of
work, and elucidation of design philosophy.

Irvin is known worldwide as an originator of the English country house look—a look not inherited, the
decorator points out, but invented in the twentieth century. His characteristic played-down grandeur includes
signature touches such as authoritative use of antiques of all eras, exquisite painted effects, rare scenic
wallpaper, faded old carpets (his favorites are those that "look as though they might be in their last week"),
spirited English and French chintzes, and loads of busts and books ("one can never have too many!").

Included in the book are more than twenty-five projects—including homes for Jacqueline Kennedy Onassis,
Katherine Graham, Rex and Mercia Harrison, and Joan Kennedy—illustrated with exceptional color
photographs drawn from Irvine's own archive. Irvine also presents his most personal projects—those
designed for his own family.
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From reader reviews:

Fernando Rowe:

The book Keith Irvine: A Life in Decoration will bring one to the new experience of reading a new book.
The author style to explain the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to read, this book very
suited to you. The book Keith Irvine: A Life in Decoration is much recommended to you to read. You can
also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Paige Robinson:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time very little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of several books in the
top collection in your reading list is definitely Keith Irvine: A Life in Decoration. This book which is
qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking right up
and review this publication you can get many advantages.

Frank Moore:

That book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Keith Irvine: A Life in Decoration was vibrant
and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Keith Irvine: A Life in Decoration has many kinds
or type. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and feel that you
are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy,
fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that will.

Mark Morrow:

A lot of people said that they feel bored when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the book Keith Irvine: A Life in Decoration to make your
own reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading talent is developing when you like reading. Try to
choose simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the impression about book and examining
especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to available a book and learn it. Beside that the publication
Keith Irvine: A Life in Decoration can to be your new friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the
information must you're doing of that time.
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