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Enter a New World of Database Programming

Visual Basic .NET and ADO.NET facilitate the development of a new generation of database applications,
including disconnected applications that run on the Web. Mastering Visual Basic .NET Database
Programming is the resource you need to thrive in this new world. Assuming no prior experience with
database programming, this book teaches you every aspect of the craft, from GUI design to server
development to middle-tier implementation. If you're familiar with earlier versions of ADO, you'll master the
many new features of ADO.NET all the more quickly. You'll also learn the importance of XML within the
new .NET paradigm.

Coverage includes:

Getting familiar with the ADO.NET object model●

Using the data access wizards●

Taking advantage of new SQL Server 2000 features●

Carrying out XSL Transformations and XPath queries●

Generating XML using the T-SQL FOR XML statement●

Binding controls to ADO.NET result sets●

Arriving at a sound database design●

Tuning your SQL Server 2000 database●

Using the XML Designer in Visual Studio .NET●

Leveraging the data access tools available in the Visual Studio .NET IDE●

Working with .NET data providers●

Choosing between streaming data and caching data●

Working with the Data Form Wizard in Visual Studio .NET●

Using advanced ADO.NET techniques●

Building a threaded application●

Using .NET's advanced exception handling capabilities●

Using the .NET Deployment Project Template●

Note: CD-ROM/DVD and other supplementary materials are not included as part of eBook file.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Bottoms:

The book Mastering Visual Basic .NET Database Programming gives you the sense of being enjoy for your
spare time. You need to use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can to be your best
friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem with the subject. If you can make examining a book
Mastering Visual Basic .NET Database Programming to get your habit, you can get a lot more advantages,
like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You can know
everything if you like open and read a e-book Mastering Visual Basic .NET Database Programming. Kinds
of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about
this book?

Micheal McDonough:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or playing
video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read a book. It is
really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day every day to reading a
publication. The book Mastering Visual Basic .NET Database Programming it is quite good to read. There
are a lot of people that recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In the event
you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore easily to
read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book offers high quality.

Martin Solomon:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, small story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not hoping Mastering Visual Basic .NET
Database Programming that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book.
Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world better then how they
react in the direction of the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading routine only for the geeky
individual but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading
through as your good habit, you could pick Mastering Visual Basic .NET Database Programming become
your personal starter.

Clifford Stoner:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many concern for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading.
Some people likes examining, not only science book but also novel and Mastering Visual Basic .NET
Database Programming or perhaps others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how
the good a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or maybe



students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In different case, beside
science book, any other book likes Mastering Visual Basic .NET Database Programming to make your spare
time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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