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Joseph Strauss (a dentist and bachelor, client of the Eleven Titties brothel and of Der Große Bär beer cellar)
leaves Prussia in the spring of 1866 and follows a captain of dragoons to Bucharest, where the officer is to
ascend the throne as prince of the United Principalities of Romania. War is imminent in central Europe, but
the company of a special tomcat, a guardian angel of sorts, helps him to overcome all dangers. 

In Bucharest, Joseph will meet and fall in love with an attractive nanny, while the prince distances himself
from the dentist, seeking to erase all stains from his past, particularly his involvement with a beautiful blind
prostitute. But unbeknownst to him, she has given birth to a baby boy with a suspiciously aristocratic nose . .
. 

Nations are invented and dissolved overnight, kingdoms are for sale, Bucharest grows from a muddy pigsty
into an elegant capital city, and love turns everything upside down in The Days of the King.
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From reader reviews:

Flora Godfrey:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important for all of us. The book The Days of the King has been making you to know about
other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The
publication The Days of the King is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to become your
friend when you experience bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your guide. Try to make
relationship while using book The Days of the King. You never feel lose out for everything should you read
some books.

Robert Wolfe:

This The Days of the King are generally reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The
reason of this The Days of the King can be among the great books you must have is definitely giving you
more than just simple looking at food but feed you actually with information that perhaps will shock your
earlier knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your
conditions at e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this The Days of the King giving you an enormous of
experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your
day activity. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Steven Young:

Reading a book to become new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to read a book. When you
learn a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and soon. The The Days of
the King provide you with new experience in reading a book.

Williams Carter:

It is possible to spend your free time to study this book this guide. This The Days of the King is simple
bringing you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not include much space to bring
typically the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the actual
book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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