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Welcome to the Symmetrical Universe Mandala and Symmetrical Images coloring book! I hope you enjoy
contemplating and coloring these complex symmetrical images. I drew every image in this book with pen
and ink on 14x17 or 14x14 paper. My drawings are all done by hand, using fine tipped Rapidiograph pens.
The way my process works is first I use a ruler and a compass to generate a pencil line grid. Once the grid is
in place I then draw the designs in ink. The images are randomly generated and sometimes change
significantly during the process of creating them. The drawings are created by drawing one symmetrical
feature at a time, much like growing a crystal. The Mandala drawings are inspired by my interest in
Hinduism, Hatha Yoga, Indian mysticism, floorplans of European cathedrals, as well as my interest in
crystallography. My drawings are an expression of the inherent beauty found in symmetrical structures. I
began drawing mandalas while attending Indian Springs School in Helena, Alabama in the 1970s. My first
mandala drawings began as simple experiments requiring a few hours to design. This eventually led to the
more complex designs which required 80 to 100 hours to complete. Some drawings are abstract geometrical
designs. In others, I have tried to incorporate archetypical symbols and shapes similar to Rorschach patterns
which may invoke a variety of conceptualizations to viewers of my artwork. Tibetan mandalas have provided
much of the inspiration for my mandala drawings. I have also found much fascination with the artwork of the
Celts, especially the Celtic knots which I have incorporated into a few designs. I have also tried, in a small
way, to emulate M.C. Escher, whose work is quite enigmatic. The majority of my drawings are done with
black ink, although some have been re-drawn in color. In this book, each section includes an original
drawing which may be too detailed to color. The following pages are all more detailed images of sections of
each drawing for you to enjoy and color. If you are interested in coloring an original drawing in the original
size, order a print from www.symmetricaluniverse.com. To get the most out of this book, I recommend using
colored pencils fine-point markers, and gel pens. Before you color on one of the drawings, use the test
section on the very last page of this book to test your coloring pencils, pens, and erasers. Check to see if your
pencils or pens look nice on the paper and make sure they don’t bleed through to the back. To see more of
my drawings, visit my webpage at www.symmetricaluniverse.com. You may order prints of any of my
drawings in a variety of sizes. You may also order my other coloring book on mechanical and steampunk
designs. Sign up for my newsletter to get updates about new drawings, new coloring books, and a schedule
of my art shows. Thank you for ordering this book. I hope you enjoy it! Steve Pitts
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From reader reviews:

Antoinette Holdren:

Here thing why this specific Symmetrical Universe Adult Coloring Book #1: Mandalas and Symmetrical
Images for Relaxation, Inspiration, and Stress Relief are different and trusted to be yours. First of all reading
a book is good but it depends in the content of the usb ports which is the content is as tasty as food or not.
Symmetrical Universe Adult Coloring Book #1: Mandalas and Symmetrical Images for Relaxation,
Inspiration, and Stress Relief giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any publication
out there but there is no guide that similar with Symmetrical Universe Adult Coloring Book #1: Mandalas
and Symmetrical Images for Relaxation, Inspiration, and Stress Relief. It gives you thrill examining journey,
its open up your current eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is perhaps can be
happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your means
home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form of
Symmetrical Universe Adult Coloring Book #1: Mandalas and Symmetrical Images for Relaxation,
Inspiration, and Stress Relief in e-book can be your alternative.

Elaine Kistler:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Symmetrical Universe Adult Coloring Book
#1: Mandalas and Symmetrical Images for Relaxation, Inspiration, and Stress Relief guide written by well-
known writer who really knows well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who else read the
book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your
personal hunger then you still uncertainty Symmetrical Universe Adult Coloring Book #1: Mandalas and
Symmetrical Images for Relaxation, Inspiration, and Stress Relief as good book but not only by the cover but
also with the content. This is one publication that can break don't assess book by its cover, so do you still
needing a different sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already
alerted you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Teresa Raap:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the
library or even make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's
spirit or real their leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to
at this time there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring
as well as can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important to suit
your needs. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word
says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Symmetrical Universe Adult Coloring Book #1:
Mandalas and Symmetrical Images for Relaxation, Inspiration, and Stress Relief can make you experience
more interested to read.



Scott Rochelle:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important and book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra Symmetrical Universe
Adult Coloring Book #1: Mandalas and Symmetrical Images for Relaxation, Inspiration, and Stress Relief.
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