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As part of the School Meals Initiative (SMI), the U.S. Department of AgricultureFood and Nutrition Service
(USDAFNS) now requires each state to regularly review the nutritional content of food served by each
School Food Authority (SFA) as part of the National School Lunch Program (NSLP). While states must
monitor the nutritional content of school meals, they are not required to forward any information to
USDAFNS. However, USDAFNS is required to measure progress to "ensure that school meals are consistent
with the Dietary Guidelines for Americans (DGA) and the Recommended Daily Allowances (RDA)." To
measure progress, USDAFNS needs to produce state and national aggregations of the nutrient content in
school lunches to show that meals in a given state or in the country as a whole are consistent with the DGA
and RDA. In addition, FNS needs to do this while imposing minimal reporting burdens on the states. The
USDAFNS contracted with Rand to look more carefully at how some states are performing SMI reviews and
how they might be able to transmit data with limited additional burden. In particular, it asked seven states to
work collaboratively with Rand through onsite, indepth interviewsto explore possible reporting systems:
California, Georgia, Nebraska, New Jersey, New York, Texas, and Wisconsin. These states were chosen as
representative of regional differences across the country and of methods for conducting SMI reviews. This
report describes the results of the analysis of possible approaches for states to report the results of their
nutritional reviews to USDAFNS.
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From reader reviews:

Carol Pyles:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They may be reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. What about the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, individual feel need book after they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will need this State Monitoring of National School Lunch Programs Nutrtional Content.

Jose Coleman:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read
a book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the whole day to reading a
guide. The book State Monitoring of National School Lunch Programs Nutrtional Content it is quite good to
read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this
book. In the event you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy typically the e-book. You
can m0ore effortlessly to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book
has high quality.

Jeffrey Bumgardner:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this State Monitoring of National School
Lunch Programs Nutrtional Content publication written by well-known writer who really knows well how to
make book which might be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written within good manner for
you, dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still uncertainty
State Monitoring of National School Lunch Programs Nutrtional Content as good book not only by the cover
but also by content. This is one book that can break don't determine book by its protect, so do you still
needing yet another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already alerted
you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Vicki Escalante:

Beside this kind of State Monitoring of National School Lunch Programs Nutrtional Content in your phone,
it might give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you
are going to got here is fresh through the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an outdated people
live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have State Monitoring of National School Lunch Programs
Nutrtional Content because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you occasionally
have book but you seldom get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that would not happen if you



have this in your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring
beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that? Find this book along with read it from today!
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