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"The Book; yes, their Book. They had no state, holding them together, no country, no soil, no king, no form
of life in common. If, in spite of this, they were one, more one than all the other peoples of the world, it was
the Book that sweated them into unity. Brown, white, black, yellow Jews, large and small, splendid and in
rags, godless and pious, they might crouch and dream all their lives in a quiet room, or fare splendidly in a
radiant, golden whirlwind over the earth, but sunk deep in all of them was the lesson of the Book. Manifold
is the world, but it is vain and fleeting as wind; but one and only is the God of Israel, the everlasting, the
infinite, the Jehovah." -Jud Süss, 1925. When Feuchtwanger’s two best known novels “Jew Süss” (“Power”)
and “Ugly Duchess” were first translated into English in the 1920s, they caused a tremendous sensation in
England and then in America. The critics all hailed Feuchtwanger as the master of the historical novel—the
peer of Dumas and Scott but written with the psychology of our own day. “Jew Süss,” set in the 18th century
Germany (at the time consisting of numerous fragmented independent states), deals with an identity crisis: in
order to gain social power, the novel's protagonist attempts to forsake his Jewish heritage and becomes
assimilated into the mainstream of German culture. More than that, Süss finds himself being in the position
of potential kingmaker. Brilliant, attractive and with an insatiable lust for power, he practically ruled the
Duke and his court, pandering to the vices of dissolute nobility, mounting through his intrigues to dizzying
heights of power. Süss’s only vulnerable spot, however, is his precious, exquisite, gentle daughter, Naomi.
When her beauty became exposed to the beastliness of the Duke, tragedy came swiftly after.
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From reader reviews:

Louise Lewis:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make them keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe can update
themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to you is you don't
know which you should start with. This Jew Süss is our recommendation so you keep up with the world.
Why, because book serves what you want and wish in this era.

William Phillips:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book this
improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of publication you read, if
you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want sense happy read
one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The particular Jew Süss is kind of e-book
which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Kenneth Wallace:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the title Jew Süss suitable to
you? The particular book was written by famous writer in this era. Often the book untitled Jew Süssis a
single of several books this everyone read now. This book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When
you read this e-book you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know prior to. The author explained
their thought in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to understand the core of this publication. This
book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the
world with this book.

Kerry Erdman:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Jew Süss can be the answer, oh how
comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your free time by reading in this
brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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